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Celebrated historian John Hirst offers a fascinating exploration of the qualities that made Europe a
world-changing civilisation.

The Shortest History of Europe begins with a rapid overview of European civilisation, describing its birth
from an unlikely mixture of classical learning, Christianity and German warrior culture. Over the centuries,
this unstable blend produced highly distinctive characters – pious knights and belligerent popes, romantics
spouting folklore and revolutionaries imitating Rome – and its coming apart provided the dynamic of
European history in modern times.

Accompanied by lively illustrations, The Shortest History of Europe is a clear, humorous and thought-
provoking account of a remarkable civilisation. This new edition brings the story into the present, covering
the world wars and beyond.

‘A wise, illuminating little book’ —Sydney Morning Herald

‘An entertaining, learned piece of historical compression’ —Age

‘Crisp, lucid and evocative’ —Australian Book Review

‘Beautifully and sparely constructed, yet rich in fact, feeling and detail, sweeping, challenging and funny’
—James Button

‘Great stuff, the book as a whole is constantly thought-provoking’ —Courier Mail

John Hirst was a member of the History Department at La Trobe University from 1968 to 2007. He has
written many books on Australian history, including Convict Society and Its Enemies, The Strange Birth of
Colonial Democracy, The Sentimental Nation, Sense and Nonsense in Australian History and The Shortest
History of Europe.
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From reader reviews:

Peter Wright:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a book. Book
has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication The Shortest History of Europe will make
you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But
some of you think this open or reading any book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they are often
thought like that? Have you searching for best book or ideal book with you?

Joyce Hazel:

The Shortest History of Europe can be one of your starter books that are good idea. All of us recommend that
straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to
get every word into pleasure arrangement in writing The Shortest History of Europe although doesn't forget
the main place, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource details that maybe you can be
considered one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial
imagining.

Barbara Wheat:

This The Shortest History of Europe is great book for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This book
reveal it facts accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences included. So if
you are read it hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having The Shortest History of
Europe in your hand like getting the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can
say that no book that offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny right but this publication already do that. So , this
can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?

Clifford McDaniel:

Within this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you must do
is just spending your time little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of the books in the top
checklist in your reading list is usually The Shortest History of Europe. This book which can be qualified as
The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upwards and review this
publication you can get many advantages.
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